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DECISION & ORDER

In an action for a divorce and ancillary relief, the
plaintiff appeals from an order of the Supreme
Court, Suffolk County (Glenn A. Murphy, J.),
dated December 20, 2018. The order, insofar as
appealed from, granted the defendant's motion for
an award of interim counsel fees to the *308  extent
of directing the plaintiff to pay interim counsel
fees for the defendant in the sum of $20,000.

308

ORDERED that the order is affirmed insofar as
appealed from, with costs.

In 2016, the plaintiff commenced this action for a
divorce and ancillary relief against the defendant.
In September 2018, the defendant moved for an
award of interim counsel fees in the sum of

$25,000. In an order dated December 20, 2018, the
Supreme Court granted the motion to the extent of
directing the plaintiff to pay interim counsel fees
for the defendant in the sum of $20,000. The
plaintiff appeals.

"The purpose of an award of interim counsel fees
is to ensure that the less monied spouse will be
able to litigate the action on equal footing with the
monied spouse" ( Tomassetti v. Tomassetti, 194
A.D.3d 882, 883, 143 N.Y.S.3d 617 [internal
quotation marks omitted]). Unlike a final award of
counsel fees, a detailed inquiry or evidentiary
hearing is not required prior to an award of interim
counsel fees (see Vistocco v. Jardine, 116 A.D.3d
842, 844, 985 N.Y.S.2d 578 ; Prichep v. Prichep,
52 A.D.3d 61, 65, 858 N.Y.S.2d 667 ). Under the
circumstances presented here, including the
disparity of income between the parties, the
plaintiff's litigation tactics, and the evidence
showing that the defendant lacked the resources
necessary to continue litigating the action, the
Supreme Court providently exercised its discretion
in granting the defendant's motion for an award of
interim counsel fees to the extent of directing the
plaintiff to pay the sum of $20,000 to the
defendant's counsel (see Domestic Relations Law
§ 237[a] ; Doscher v. Doscher, 137 A.D.3d 962,
965, 27 N.Y.S.3d 231 ; Rosenbaum v. Rosenbaum,
55 A.D.3d 713, 714, 866 N.Y.S.2d 234 ; Prichep v.
Prichep, 52 A.D.3d at 65–66, 858 N.Y.S.2d 667 ).

BARROS, J.P., MILLER, GENOVESI and
TAYLOR, JJ., concur.

1

https://casetext.com/case/tomassetti-v-tomassetti#p883
https://casetext.com/case/tomassetti-v-tomassetti
https://casetext.com/case/vistocco-v-jardine-3#p844
https://casetext.com/case/vistocco-v-jardine-3
https://casetext.com/case/prichep-v-prichep#p65
https://casetext.com/case/prichep-v-prichep
https://casetext.com/statute/consolidated-laws-of-new-york/chapter-domestic-relations/article-13-provisions-applicable-to-more-than-one-type-of-matrimonial-action/section-237-counsel-fees-and-expenses
https://casetext.com/case/doscher-v-doscher-9#p965
https://casetext.com/case/doscher-v-doscher-9
https://casetext.com/case/rosenbaum-v-rosenbaum-3#p714
https://casetext.com/case/rosenbaum-v-rosenbaum-3
https://casetext.com/case/prichep-v-prichep#p65
https://casetext.com/case/prichep-v-prichep


2

Chiarello v. Chiarello     214 A.D.3d 853 (N.Y. App. Div. 2023)

https://casetext.com/case/chiarello-v-chiarello-3

